
BID #FY180022
MCHS Band Instruments
11:00 p.m. Wednesday, April 18, 2018

Company Name Drum Stand Podium
Symphony 

Stand Cabinet Mallets Cymbals Vibraphone Euphoniums
 Tenor 

Saxophone
Baritone 

Saxophone Oboe

K & S Musiz * Bid is for RD Berkley BS509 $2,795.00

Sam Ash Quikship Corp $515.00 no Bid $55.98 no bid $55.00 $337.00 $3,225.00 $3,458.00 $2,409.00 $6,750.00 $3,124.00

Washington Music Center $555.20 no bid $53.10 $1,835.00 $67.80 $578.00 $3,234.50 $3,442.50 $2,396.95 $6,726.75 $3,090.45

Taylor Music. Inc. Drum Stand Bid is #PBE3616/F46 $1,211.00 $533.00 $69.00 no bid $53.98 $444.00 $3,288.00 $3,488.00 $2,393.00 $6,722.00 no bid

Amro Music Stores, Inc $725.00 $504.98 $76.49 $1,764.00 $64.98 $550.26 $3,504.00 $3,654.00 $2,523.00 $7,004.00 $3,148.00 $23,518.71

Alamo Music Center $340.00 $699.00 $60.00 $1,450.00 $68.00 $490.00 $3,800.00 $3,430.00 $2,393.00 $6,700.00 $3,150.00

Music & Arts $512.00 no bid $59.00 no bid no bid $439.00 $3,191.00 $3,376.00 $2,350.00 $6,596.00 $3,120.00

West Music Company $1,360.00 no bid no bid no bid $27.56 $520.00 $4,063.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid

Bocal Majority Bassoon Camp, LLC $3,423.00


